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APPENDIX A: MEDICATION GUIDE REMS TEMPLATE 
 

Application number TRADE NAME (DRUG NAME)  

Class of Product as per label 
 

Applicant name 
Address 

Contact Information 
 

 RISK EVALUATION AND MITIGATION STRATEGY (REMS) 

I.  GOAL(S):   
 List the goals and objectives of the REMS. 

II. REMS ELEMENTS: 
 
 A.  Medication Guide  
A Medication Guide will be dispensed with each [drug name] prescription.   [Describe in 
detail how you will comply with 21 CFR 208.24.] 
 

B. Timetable for Submission of Assessments 
 

For products approved under an NDA or BLA, specify the timetable for submission of 
assessments of the REMS.  The timetable for submission of assessments shall be no less 
frequent than by 18 months, 3 years, and in the 7th year after the REMS is initially 
approved. You should specify the reporting interval (dates) that each assessment will 
cover and the planned date of submission to the FDA of the assessment.  To facilitate 
inclusion of as much information as possible while allowing reasonable time to prepare 
the submission, the reporting interval covered by each assessment should conclude no 
earlier than 60 days before the submission date for that assessment. For example, the 
reporting interval covered by an assessment that is to be submitted by July 31st should 
conclude no earlier than June 1st. 
    
Include the following paragraph in your REMS:  
 
COMPANY will submit REMS Assessments to the FDA <<Insert schedule of 
assessments: at a minimum, by 18 months, by 3 years and in the 7th year from the date of 
approval of the REMS.>> To facilitate inclusion of as much information as possible 
while allowing reasonable time to prepare the submission, the reporting interval covered 
by each assessment should conclude no earlier than 60 days before the submission date 
for that assessment.  COMPANY will submit each assessment so that it will be received 
by the FDA on or before the due date. 



APPENDIX B: 
REMS SUPPORTING DOCUMENT TEMPLATE 
MEDICATION GUIDE REMS 
 
 
This REMS Supporting Document should include the following listed sections 1 through 
6.  Include in section 4 the reason that the Medication Guide proposed to be included in 
the REMS is necessary to ensure that the benefits of the drug outweigh the risks.   
 
1. Table of Contents 
 
2. Background 
 
3. Goals 
 
4. Supporting Information on Proposed REMS Elements 

 
a.    Medication Guide 

 
b. Timetable for Submission of Assessments of the REMS (for products 

approved under an NDA or BLA) 
 
5. REMS Assessment Plan (for products approved under an NDA or BLA) 
 
6. Other Relevant Information 
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