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On the evening of November 29, 1944, at the Archbishop's Palace in Vienna, 
there occurred a poetry reading devoted to the works of Hildegard Jone. The 
evening was sponsored by Dr. Otto Mauer, a priest, professor, and patron of 
modern art who was also a personal friend of Jone's. The poetry reading was 
one of many such events that Mauer organized during the latter days of World 
War II, for the cultural and spiritual edification of his parishioners.1 The same 
poetry reading occasioned the elegant manuscript at hand, a manuscript 
prepared by Anton Webern that contains all of the Jone texts he set to music.2 

The evening's program was planned from the very outset around the poems 
Webern had set to music. Jone envisioned Webern as reciter, and she also 
specifically requested a copy of the texts in Webern's hand. On April 25, 1944, 
she wrote to Webern: 

Please, dear Anton, write out the texts for me sometime in the future, in your 
own hand, in the correct sequence: I would like so very much to have them, 
perhaps as well with the indication that they are your texts. 

Webern acknowledged Jone's request shortly thereafter and completed the 
manuscript by June 2, 1944.3 

The question of who would serve as the evening's reciter proved considerably 
more problematic. In her attempt to persuade Webern to assume the role, Jone 
argued: 

Regarding the recitation by you, that would frankly be the only satisfactory 
solution. Professional actors are, in a very large sense, dilettantes. Somehow, a 
word spoken by you truly is already entirely the music that you perceive in it: 
really your music. 
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This was apparently not the first time Jone had mentioned her desire for 
Webern to recite the poems. In an earlier letter, the composer had remarked that 
he was "pleased" (glücklich) and "fascinated!" (fasziniert!) with the idea of 
reciting the poems, but in such matters he was "unfortunately a 
dilettante" (hence Jone's later remark that professional actors were true 
dilettantes), adding "between the two of us, I regret this!"4 Webern, in turn, 
tried his best to convince Jone that she should recite the poems. 

but the reading, the reading, dear Hilde, only you yourself should do it! What 
an impressive rendering you recently gave of your own poems and one of 
Goethe's. Recall how my wife reacted to it! Believe me, you must decide to do 
it! Consider the idea! What an experience it could be for an audience, attendant 
upon you in the highest anticipation!!! Think of that! 

In the end, neither artist proved successful in convincing the other, and the task 
of reciting the poems ultimately fell to Werner Riemerschmid, a former 
neighbor of Webern's and a poet in his own right.5 

As the date for the poetry reading approached, Webern became increasingly 
involved in the event's organization. In addition to Jone's poems, the evening 
was scheduled to include performances of the composer's Drei Gesänge aus 
"Viae inviae" von Hildegard Jone, op. 23, and the Drei Lieder; op. 25. The 
songs were eventually sacrificed when the original singer left Vienna for her 
native Sweden, and the "exceptional" singer Webern secured as a replacement 
demanded an honorarium.6 Had the songs been performed, it would have 
marked the first and only time the composer heard a live public performance of 
any of his Jone settings. 

When a performance of the songs became impossible, Webern proposed as 
alternative musical selections his Variationen für Klavier, op. 27 and Berg's 
Sonata für Klavier, op. 1. At the last minute, however, and for reasons largely 
of programming, Webern substituted for his own work one of Mozart's lesser-
known Fantasien.7 The change came about when Mauer asked for a musical 
selection to open the program. Since the audience was to consist of musical 
laymen (primarily church officials and parishioners), Webern decided that the 
evening should begin with a classical composition. Although Jone strenuously 



objected to the change, Webern argued that his own work might prove 
"problematic" and lead to "an occasion for head shaking and so on." The 
musical selections for the evening were ultimately limited to Berg's Sonata and 
the Mozart Fantasia, both performed by Olga Novacovic.8 

Webern took an equally strong interest in the literary portion of the program. 
Using the manuscript he had prepared, the composer coached Riemerschmid to 
ensure that the latter's spoken renditions might approach his own musical 
interpretations. He further advised Riemerschmid to allow for "decided 
pauses" (ausdrückliche Trennungen) between individual works. In addition, 
Webern was apparently responsible for revising the sequence of poems for the 
evening's program. Although he had copied the poems according to his own 
opus numbers, beginning with the texts for the Drei Gesänge, op. 23, Webern 
reordered the manuscript to begin with the poems for the Drei Lieder, op. 25. 
This change is revealed by the repagination on the pages shown herein. The 
original page numbers, written in red pencil, had positioned the texts for the 
Drei Gesänge as pages 1­2, followed by the texts for the Drei Lieder as page 3. 
The original page numbers have been written over in lead pencil, so that the 
lieder texts now precede those for the Gesänge. 

Webern's motivation for the revision may have been one of pacing. He may 
have felt that the short, lyric nature poems he had set as op. 25 would be more 
appropriate to commence the poetry portion of the program, as opposed to the 
texts for op. 23, which are longer, elegiac, and more deeply spiritual in nature. 
Then too, the texts for the Gesänge, op. 23 and Das Augenlicht, op. 26 are all 
taken from Jone's cycle "Viae inviae"; the revised manuscript ordering thus 
places the "Viae inviae" texts together. 

Another program change concerns the addition of Jone's "Lumen" cycle to 
conclude the program. Webern had recently turned to the opening lines of the 
cycle ("Das Sonnenlicht spricht") in sketching a project left incomplete upon 
his death.9 While he and Jone had earlier entertained the idea of including the 
"Lumen" poems on the program, the decision to add them was not made until 
mid-November, just days before the event and largely at Riemerschmid's 
urging.10 Since they were added at the last minute, the "Lumen" poems were 
read from a separate Jone autograph. It is also possible that selections from 
Jone's Selige Augen (Freiburg im Breisgau: Herder Verlag, 1938) were read, as 
Webern lent a copy of the volume to Riemerschmid before their final coaching 
session, when the evening's program was to be determined.11 



One curious feature of Webern's poetry manuscript concerns the presence of 
Jone's handwriting on the back of one leaf. In preparing the manuscript, Webern 
wrote almost exclusively on the recto sides of pages; however, the verso of 
page 7 contains the poem "Schöpfen aus Brunnen," written in Jone's hand. 
Webern set this poem as the third movement of his Kantate, op. 31. He used the 
reverse side of Jone's page to copy out "Schweigt auch die Welt," the text for 
op. 31, movement I, which he indicated as page 7. He then pasted a separate 
sheet over Jone's poem and copied the text for "Sehr tiefverhalten innerst Leben 
singt," the poem he set as op. 31, movement II; this page is indicated as page 8. 
"Schöpfen aus Brunnen" was then recopied on a fresh page, which now follows 
as facing page 9. It is unclear why Webern broke his pattern of writing on recto 
sides only when he came to these texts, why he intentionally obscured Jone's 
original poem, or why he incorporated Jone's autograph leaf into the manuscript 
at all. 
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