## Instructions for Completing the IRS Tax Authorization Form 8821

SBA requires you to complete the IRS Form 8821 as a part of your disaster loan application submission. The form authorizes the IRS to provide federal income tax information directly to SBA. Although the form is available online, it cannot be transmitted electronically.

The IRS Form 8821 must be completed and submitted with each SBA disaster loan application, even if you are not required to file a federal income tax return.

A separate IRS Form 8821 must be returned with the SBA disaster loan application for:

- (1) each disaster loan applicant (individuals filing joint returns may use a single IRS Form 8821),
- (2) each corporation or partnership in which the disaster loan applicant holds a 50% or greater interest,
- (3) each individual or entity which holds a 20% or greater interest in the disaster loan applicant,
- (4) each general partner, and
- (5) each affiliate business.

## Only Fill In Blocks 1 and 7

- Enter the name(s) and address of the individual taxpayer(s), or business (whichever is applicable) and address in block 1. If you file a joint tax return, include the names and address of both filers.
- Next, enter the taxpayer identification number(s), i.e. Social Security number (SSN). If you file a joint tax return, include the SSN for both tax filers: xxx-xx-xxxx / xxx-xx-xxxx

If the authorization is for a corporation or a partnership, enter the Employer Identification number (EIN): xx-xxxxxxx

- Sign, date and print name(s) in **block 7.**
- If you filed a joint tax return, only one spouse is required to sign.
- For a corporation, the IRS Form 8821
  must be signed by the President or
  Chief Executive Officer of the
  corporation. If the 8821 is signed by
  any other officer, the signature must
  be attested to by another corporate
  officer with their signature, date, and
  title also appearing on the 8821.

Form <b>8821</b>	Tax Information	n Authorization	OME No. 1545-1165 For IRS Use Only
(Rev. October 2011)	► Do not sign this form unless all app	nlicable lines have been completed	Received by: Name
Department of the Treasury	▶ Do not use this form to request a c	o not use this form to request a copy or transcript of your tax return. Instead, use Form 4506 or Form 4506-T.	
Internal Revenue Service	,		
<ol> <li>Taxpayer information. Tax Taxpayer name(s) and address (type or pr</li> </ol>	payer(s) must sign and date this for	rm on line 7.  Taxpayer identification num	hor
raxpayer riame(s) and address (type or pr	m)	Taxpayer Identification Hum	Dei
		Daytime telephone number	Plan number (if applicable)
0. 4		-b - l'-t - thi- f	
2 Appointee. If you wish to n Name and address	ame more than one appointee, atta	CAF No.	
U.S. Small Business Administ	ation	PTIN	
Office of Disaster Assistance	attori	Telephone No.	
		Fax No.	
3 Tax matters The appoints	e is authorized to inspect and/or red		Telephone No. Fax No. in any office of the IRS for the
tax matters listed on this lin	e. Do not use Form 8821 to request	t copies of tax returns.	in any office of the into for the
(a) Type of Tax	(b) Tax Form Number	(c) Year(s) or Period(s)	(d) Specific Tax Matters (see instr.)
Type of Tax (Income, Employment, Excise, et	(1040, 941, 720, etc.)	(see the instructions for line 3)	Specific Tax Matters (see instr.)
or orner order,			
Income	1040, 1065, 1120, 990, 1041	2008, 2009, 2010 and 2011	Tax Return Transcript
Income and Employment Tax	940, 941, 943, 944, 945, 990	2008 through 2011	Installment Agreement, Out-
income and Employment Tax	540, 541, 543, 544, 545, 550	2000 tillough 2011	installment Agreement, Out-
Civil Penalties			-tt B-ttt t t
Specific use not recorded use not recorded on CAF, c     Disclosure of tax informal all you want copies of tax basis, check this box	on Centralized Authorization Fil heck this box. See the instructions ion (you must check a box on line information, notices, and other with	on page 4. If you check this box,  5a or 5b unless the box on line 4 ritten communications sent to the	skip lines 5 and 6
4 Specific use not recorder use not recorded use not recorded on CAF, of 5 Disclosure of tax informat all fyou want copies of tax basis, check this box.  Note. Appointees will no lo bif you do not want any copi  6 Retention/revocation of tauthorizations for the same to revoke a prior tax informand check this box.  To revoke this tax informati  7 Signature of taxpayer(s), corporate officer, partner, get that I have the authority to the prior of the prior to the prior t	ion (you must check a box on line information, notices, and other writers)	on page 4. If you check this box, 5a or 5b unless the box on line 4 itten communications sent to the dother related materials with the ant to your appointee, check this is tax information authorization as you checked the box ch a copy of any authorizations you need to the box ch a copy of any authorizations you need to the box ch a copy of any authorizations you need to the box ch a copy of any authorizations you need to the box ch a copy of any authorizations you need to the box ch a copy of any authorizations you need to the box ch a copy of any authorizations you need to the box ch a copy of any authorization of any authorization will be a community of the box characteristics of the b	uthorization is for a specific skip lines 5 and 6
4 Specific use not recorder use not recorded use not recorded on CAF, of 5 Disclosure of tax informat all fyou want copies of tax basis, check this box.  Note. Appointees will no lo bif you do not want any copi  6 Retention/revocation of tauthorizations for the same to revoke a prior tax informand check this box.  To revoke this tax informati  7 Signature of taxpayer(s), corporate officer, partner, get that I have the authority to the prior of the prior to the prior t	ion (you must check a box on line information, notices, and other writinger receive forms, publications are set of notices or communications. This tax matters you listed on line 3 abation authorization, you must attar on authorization, see the instruction of a tax matter applies to a joint return authorization, executor, receiver, administration, the second of the	on page 4. If you check this box, 5a or 5b unless the box on line 4 itten communications sent to the dother related materials with the ant to your appointee, check this is tax information authorization as you checked the box ch a copy of any authorizations you need to the box ch a copy of any authorizations you need to the box ch a copy of any authorizations you need to the box ch a copy of any authorizations you need to the box ch a copy of any authorizations you need to the box ch a copy of any authorizations you need to the box ch a copy of any authorizations you need to the box ch a copy of any authorization of any authorization will be a community of the box characteristics of the b	uthorization is for a specific skip lines 5 and 6
Specific use not recorder use not recorded on CAF, of Disclosure of tax informating of the content of the	ion (you must check a box on line information, notices, and other writinger receive forms, publications and see of notices or communications see of notices or communications. The tax matters you listed on line 3 abation authorization, you must attation authorization, see the instruction of a tax matter applies to a joint return audition, executor, receiver, administration, authorization with respect to the ATED, THIS TAX INFORMATION ARM IF IT IS BLANK OR INCOMPLE	on page 4. If you check this box, 5a or 5b unless the box on line 4 itten communications sent to the dother related materials with the ant to your appointee, check this is tax information authorization a your unless you checked the box ch a copy of any authorizations you need to see the box on page 4.  Imp. either husband or wife must strator, trustee, or party other that et ax matters/periods on line 3 ab AUTHORIZATION WILL BE RETUETE.	uthorization is for a specific skip lines 5 and 6
4 Specific use not recorder use not recorded use not recorded on CAF, of 5 Disclosure of tax informat all fyou want copies of tax basis, check this box.  Note. Appointees will no lo bif you do not want any copi  6 Retention/revocation of tauthorizations for the same to revoke a prior tax informand check this box.  To revoke this tax informati  7 Signature of taxpayer(s), corporate officer, partner, get that I have the authority to the prior of the prior to the prior t	ion (you must check a box on line information, notices, and other writinger receive forms, publications are set of notices or communications. This tax matters you listed on line 3 abation authorization, you must attar on authorization, see the instruction of a tax matter applies to a joint return authorization, executor, receiver, administration, the second of the	on page 4. If you check this box, 5a or 5b unless the box on line 4 itten communications sent to the dother related materials with the ant to your appointee, check this is tax information authorization as you checked the box ch a copy of any authorizations you need to the box ch a copy of any authorizations you need to the box ch a copy of any authorizations you need to the box ch a copy of any authorizations you need to the box ch a copy of any authorizations you need to the box ch a copy of any authorizations you need to the box ch a copy of any authorizations you need to the box ch a copy of any authorization of any authorization will be a community of the box characteristics of the b	uthorization is for a specific skip lines 5 and 6
4 Specific use not recorder use not recorded use not recorded on CAF, of Disclosure of tax informat alf you want copies of tax basis, check this box  Note. Appointees will no lob lif you do not want any copi 6 Retention/revocation of tauthorizations for the same to revoke a prior tax informand check this box  To revoke this tax informati 7 Signature of taxpayer(s). corporate officer, payriner, that I have the authority to be IF NOT SIGNED AND D.  DO NOT SIGNED AND D.	ion (you must check a box on line information, notices, and other writinger receive forms, publications and see of notices or communications see of notices or communications. The tax matters you listed on line 3 abation authorization, you must attation authorization, see the instruction of a tax matter applies to a joint return audition, executor, receiver, administration, authorization with respect to the ATED, THIS TAX INFORMATION ARM IF IT IS BLANK OR INCOMPLE	on page 4. If you check this box, 5a or 5b unless the box on line 4 itten communications sent to the dother related materials with the ant to your appointee, check this is tax information authorization a your unless you checked the box ch a copy of any authorizations you need to see the box on page 4.  Imp. either husband or wife must strator, trustee, or party other that et ax matters/periods on line 3 ab AUTHORIZATION WILL BE RETUETE.	uthorization is for a specific skip lines 5 and 6
4 Specific use not recorder use not recorded use not recorded on CAF, of Disclosure of tax informat alf you want copies of tax basis, check this box  Note. Appointees will no lobl flyou do not want any copies of tax authorizations for the same to revoke a prior tax informand check this box  To revoke this tax informati  7 Signature of taxpayer(s). corporate officer, partner, gothat I have the authority to bif NOT SIGNED AND D.  DO NOT SIGN THIS FOIl Signature  Print Name	ion (you must check a box on line information, notices, and other winger receive forms, publications amended in the property of the property o	on page 4. If you check this box, 5a or 5b unless the box on line 4 litten communications sent to the dother related materials with the net to your appointee, check this I the sent to you appointee, check this I is tax information authorization as over unless you checked the box och a copy of any authorizations on some page 4.  Imperitually the properties of the propert	uthorization is for a specific skip lines 5 and 6